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A businessman was charged yester-
day with 40 counts of insulting the 
modesty  of  three  female  victims  
and  one  count  of  having  uncen-
sored films. 

Lin Li Hao, 44, the managing di-
rector of a manufacturing firm, is al-
leged to have secretly taken videos 
of  the  victims  between  February  
2014 and April  this year,  at  loca-
tions such as his office premises. 

He allegedly intruded on their pri-
vacy by filming  them  while  they  
were in the toilet, or taking videos 
up their skirts.

The 41st  charge accuses him of 

having  uncensored  films  that  he  
had filmed overseas. 

Lin is represented by Mr Anand 
Nalachandran. His case will be men-
tioned on Nov 8.

If convicted of insulting the mod-
esty of a woman, Lin can be jailed 
for up to one year and/or fined per 
charge.

Anyone found guilty of having un-
censored films can be fined not less 
than $100 for each such film, up to a 
maximum of $20,000.

District Judge Kan Shuk Weng is-
sued a gag order,  prohibiting the 
publication  of  anything  that  will  
lead to the identities of the victims 
named in the charges. 
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A businessman told a renovation 
contractor to mark up a quote for a 
project at a beach club in Sentosa 
by about $100,000 in return for 
awarding him the contract, a court 
heard.

Johnny Tan, 55, also asked Con-
cepcion Interiors director Tan Kok 
Wah, 51, to pay him a part of the in-
voiced  amount  after  each  pay-
ment was received by him for the 
project. Mr Tan Kok Wah agreed as 
he understood he had to mark up 
the quote to secure the contract. 

Johnny Tan, a shareholder of Az-
zura Resorts, a beach resort and 
water sports  hub on Sentosa is-
land, was jailed for four weeks and 
ordered  to  pay  a  penalty  of
$46,000 yesterday. 

He had admitted to two of six 
counts  of  corruption:  getting  a  
$10,000 bribe on  Dec 15,  2009,  
and a $3,000 bribe on Jan 14, 2010, 
from Mr Tan Kok Wah in return for 
awarding the interior fitting works 
of Azzura Resorts to Concepcion 
Interiors. Four other charges in-
volving a  total  of  $33,000 were  
considered during sentencing.

Deputy  Public  Prosecutor  Jas-
min Kaur had said that some time 
in June 2009, Mr Tan Kok Wah told 
the accused he was going to quote 
about $400,000 for a renovation 
project at Azzura. Johnny Tan then 
told him to mark up his quote and 
to  pay  him  a  portion  of  the  in-
voiced amount after each payment 
was received  for  the  project. Mr 
Tan Kok Wah submitted a marked-
up quotation of $566,243, and the 
contract was given to Concepcion.

Mr Tan Kok Wah started the reno-
vation in July 2009, but Johnny Tan 
did not have enough money to pay 
him in full for the project. Conse-
quently, the sum that Mr Tan Kok 
Wah eventually paid Johnny Tan 
was not a portion of the invoiced 
amount.  Instead,  he  would  pay  
Johnny Tan ad hoc as requested af-
ter  each  invoice  payment  was  
made. Between July 2009 and Janu-
ary 2010, Mr Tan Kok Wah made 
several payments to Johnny Tan at 
the latter’s  request,  after  the in-
voices had been paid. 

Mr Tan Kok Wah was sentenced 
to nine weeks’ jail in April 2015 on 
five of 26 corruption charges. The 
prosecution successfully appealed 
and the High Court upped his sen-
tence to 12 weeks in May last year.

Johnny Tan, represented by Mr 
S.S. Dhillon, could have been fined 
up to $100,000 and jailed for up to 
five years per charge. 
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He allegedly filmed them in the toilet; he is 
also accused of having uncensored films
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